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1 Kings 15:9–23 NASB95

So in the twentieth year of 
Jeroboam the king of Israel, Asa 
began to reign as king of Judah. 
    He reigned forty-one years in 
Jerusalem; and his mother’s name 
was Maacah the daughter of 



Psalm 147:11 NASB95

1 Kings 15:9–11 NASB95

Abishalom. 
    Asa did what was right in the 
sight of...

The LORD favors those who fear 
Him, 
         Those who wait for His 
lovingkindness.

So in the twentieth year of 
Jeroboam the king of Israel, Asa 
began to reign as king of Judah. 



1 Kings 15:12–13 NASB95

    He reigned forty-one years in 
Jerusalem; and his mother’s name 
was Maacah the daughter of 
Abishalom. 
    Asa did what was right in the 
sight of...

He also put away the male cult 
prostitutes from the land and 
removed all the idols which his 
fathers had made. 
    He also removed Maacah his 
mother from being queen mother, 
because she had made a horrid 



Luke 14:26 NASB95

1 Kings 15:14–15 NASB95

image as an Asherah; and Asa cut 
down her...

“If anyone comes to Me, and does 
not hate his own father and mother 
and wife and children and brothers 
and sisters, yes, and even his own 
life, he cannot be My disciple.

But the high places were not taken 
away; nevertheless the heart of Asa 
was wholly devoted to the LORD 



1 Kings 15:16–19 NASB95

all his days. 
    He brought into the house of the 
LORD the dedicated things of his 
father and his own dedicated things: 
silver and gold and...

Now there was war between Asa 
and Baasha king of Israel all their 
days. 
    Baasha king of Israel went up 
against Judah and fortified Ramah 
in order to prevent anyone from 
going out or coming in to Asa king 
of Judah. 
    Then Asa took all the...



Exodus 23:8 NASB95

Ecclesiastes 7:7 NASB95

Ezekiel 17:15 NASB95

“You shall not take a bribe, for a 
bribe blinds the clear-sighted and 
subverts the cause of the just.

For oppression makes a wise man 
mad, 
         And a bribe corrupts the heart.



2 Chronicles 16:7–10 NASB95

‘But he rebelled against him by 
sending his envoys to Egypt that 
they might give him horses and 
many troops. Will he succeed? Will 
he who does such things escape? 
Can he indeed break the covenant 
and escape?

At that time Hanani the seer came to 
Asa king of Judah and said to him, 
“Because you have relied on the 
king of Aram and have not relied on 
the LORD your God, therefore the 
army of the king of Aram has 



Romans 15:4 NASB95

Romans 15:13 NASB95

escaped out of your hand. 
    “Were not the...

For whatever was written in earlier 
times was written for our 
instruction, so that through 
perseverance and the 
encouragement of the Scriptures we 
might have hope.

Now may the God of hope fill you 
with all joy and peace in believing, 



so that you will abound in hope by 
the power of the Holy Spirit.
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